

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE			OPENING DATE									
SEE PAGE 3			THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 6, 2020 @ 2:00 P.M.									
CONTRACT NUMBER AND TITLE												
MUA-EQUIP-05-20 FURNISH AND DELIVER PETROLEUM OIL AND LUBRICANT PRODUCTS			PETROCHOICE, LLC		PPC LUBRICANTS, INC.		DAVID WEBER OIL CO.		CUMMINS, INC. D/B/A/ CUMMINS SALES AND SERVICE			
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE
PART A: MOBIL DELVAC 1300 SUPER 15W-40 MOTOR OIL												
OR APPROVED EQUIVALENT			MOBIL DELVAC 15W40		SUNOCO SUPER C 15W40 CK-4		GIBALTAR ULTRA LX		VALVOLINE ALL FLEET 15W40			
MANUFACTURER AND PRODUCT:												
1	PER GALLON, 55 GALLON DRUM DELIVERY	1,600	11.11	17,776.00	7.54	12,064.00	9.47	15,152.00	10.81	17,296.00		
2	PER GALLON, TOTE DELIVERY	1,600	10.65	17,040.00	7.45	11,920.00	9.47	15,152.00	10.49	16,784.00		
3	PER GALLON, BULK DELIVERY (MINIMUM 250 GALLONS)	1,600	10.50	16,800.00	6.94	11,104.00	9.47	15,152.00	8.73	13,968.00		
TOTAL AMOUNT BID PART A			51,616.00		35,088.00		45,456.00		48,048.00			
PART B: MOBIL DELVAC CNG/LNG 15W-40 MOTOR OIL												
OR APPROVED EQUIVALENT			MOBIL DELVAC MODERN CNG/LNG		SUNOCO MOBILE LAX GEO 15W40		GIBALTAR ULTRA 92 NCEO 15W40		VALVOLINE PREMIUM BLUE ONE SOLUTION 9200 15W40			
MANUFACTURER AND PRODUCT:												
1	PER GALLON, 55 GALLON DRUM DELIVERY	250	22.65	5,662.50	9.25	2,312.50	11.47	2,867.50	12.88	3,220.00		
2	PER GALLON, BULK DELIVERY	250	NOT AVAIL.		9.25	2,312.50	11.47	2,867.50	12.48	3,120.00		
3	PER GALLON, BULK DELIVERY (MINIMUM 250 GALLONS)	250	NOT AVAIL.		9.25	2,312.50	11.47	2,867.50	10.86	2,715.00		
TOTAL AMOUNT BID PART B			5,662.50		6,937.50		8,602.50		9,055.00			
PART C: MOBILFLUID 424 HYDRAULIC TRACTOR OIL												
OR APPROVED EQUIVALENT			MOBIL 424		SUNOCO UTF		UNIVERSAL TRACTOR FLUID		VALVOLINE UNITRAC HYDRAULIC FLUID			
MANUFACTURER AND PRODUCT:												
1	PER GALLON, 55 GALLON DRUM DELIVERY	2,000	9.38	18,760.00	6.58	13,160.00	7.96	15,920.00	10.18	20,360.00		
2	PER GALLON, BULK DELIVERY	2,000	8.65	17,300.00	6.49	12,980.00	7.96	15,920.00	8.91	17,820.00		
3	PER GALLON, BULK (MINIMUM 250 GALLONS)	2,000	8.65	17,300.00	5.98	11,960.00	7.96	15,920.00	8.08	16,160.00		
TOTAL AMOUNT BID PART C			53,360.00		38,100.00		47,760.00		54,340.00			
PART D: MOBIL PEGASUS 605 ULTRA 40 MOTOR OIL												
OR APPROVED EQUIVALENT			MOBIL PEGASUS 605 ULTRA		SHELL MYSELLA S3 N 40 W		NO BID		VALVOLINE PREMIUM BLUE GEO LOW ASH SEA 40			
MANUFACTURER AND PRODUCT:												
1	PER GALLON, 55 GALLON DRUM DELIVERY	6,000	19.10	114,600.00	8.14	48,840.00			13.51	81,060.00		
2	PER GALLON, TOTE DELIVERY	6,000	NOT AVAIL.		8.00	48,000.00			12.86	77,160.00		
3	PER GALLON, BULK DELIVERY (MINIMUM 250 GALLONS)	6,000	13.72	82,320.00	7.49	44,940.00			11.29	67,740.00		
TOTAL AMOUNT BID PART D			196,920.00		141,780.00				225,960.00			

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE		OPENING DATE											
SEE PAGE 3		THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 6, 2020 @ 2:00 P.M.											
CONTRACT NUMBER AND TITLE				PETROCHOICE, LLC		PPC LUBRICANTS, INC.		DAVID WEBER OIL CO.		CUMMINS, INC. D/B/A/ CUMMINS SALES AND SERVICE			
MUA-EQUIP-05-20 FURNISH AND DELIVER PETROLEUM OIL AND LUBRICANT PRODUCTS													
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	
	PART E: AIR 1 DEF - DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID												
	OR APPROVED EQUIVALENT												
	MANUFACTURER AND PRODUCT:												
			AIR 1 DEF		DRYDENE DIESELALL DEF		BLUESKY DEF		FLEETGUARD DEF				
1	PER GALLON, 55 GALLON DRUM DELIVERY	4,000	2.11	8,440.00	2.41	9,640.00	2.24	8,960.00	2.83	11,320.00			
2	PER GALLON, TOTE DELIVERY	4,000	1.92	7,680.00	2.30	9,200.00	1.98	7,920.00	2.55	10,200.00			
3	PER GALLON, BULK DELIVERY (MINIMUM 250 GALLONS)	4,000	1.60	6,400.00	1.55	6,200.00	1.59	6,360.00	1.89	7,560.00			
	TOTAL AMOUNT BID PART E			22,520.00		25,040.00		23,240.00		29,080.00			
	PART F: PEAK THERMAL CHARGE XL ETHYLENE GLYCOL												
	COOLANT OR APPROVED EQUIVALENT												
	MANUFACTURER AND PRODUCT		THERMAL CHARGE XL		OLD WORLD INDUSTRIES THERMAL CHARGE XL EG		NO BID		FLEETGUARD ES COMPLEAT OAT				
1	PER GALLON, 55 GALLON DRUM DELIVERY	2,500	10.47	26,175.00	15.55	38,875.00			5.92	14,800.00			
2	PER GALLON, TOTE DELIVERY	2,500	NOT AVAIL.		15.11	37,775.00			5.66	14,150.00			
3	PER GALLON, BULK DELIVERY (MINIMUM 250 GALLONS)	2,500	NOT AVAIL.		14.60	36,500.00			N/A				
	TOTAL AMOUNT BID PART F		MATH ERROR	26,175.00		113,150.00				28,950.00			
	PART G: KLUBER ASONIC GH7Z GREASE												
	OR APPROVED EQUIVALENT												
	MANUFACTURER AND PRODUCT		KLUBER ASONIC GH7Z		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID				
1	PER 400 GRAM TUBE	50	195.30	9,765.00									
	TOTAL AMOUNT BID PART G			9,765.00									
			MATH ERROR: PART F - EXTENDED PRICE AND TOTAL AMOUNT BID ON PROPOSAL PAGE SAYS \$26,182.00, SHOULD BE \$26,175.00										

