

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE		OPENING DATE											
\$130,000.00		THURSDAY, OCTOBER 24, 2019 @ 2:00 P.M.											
CONTRACT NUMBER AND TITLE				MULTI-TEMP MECHANICAL, INC.		MCCLOSKEY MECHANICAL CONTRACTORS, INC.		JMO MECHANICAL D/B/A POLAR BEAR MECHANICAL		A.A. DUCKETT, INC.		FALASCA MECHANICAL, INC.	
MISC-30-19 2020 MISCELLANEOUS SERVICES - HVAC WORK				UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	
1	HOURLY CHARGE - BOILER WORK - BOILER MECHANIC'S HELPER - REGULAR HOURS W/PROFIT & OVERHEAD	80	36.13	2,890.40	45.00	3,600.00	40.00	3,200.00	109.00	8,720.00	68.00	5,440.00	
2	HOURLY CHARGE - BOILER WORK - BOILER MECHANIC REGULAR HOURS - W/PROFIT & OVERHEAD	80	85.00	6,800.00	80.00	6,400.00	86.00	6,880.00	NO BID	NO BID	120.00	9,600.00	
3	HOURLY CHARGE - SHEET METAL FIELD WORK - SHEET METAL MECHANIC'S HELPER - REGULAR HOURS W/PROFIT & OVERHEAD	60	45.92	2,755.20	45.00	2,700.00	40.00	2,400.00	NO BID	NO BID	68.00	4,080.00	
4	HOURLY CHARGE - SHEET METAL FIELD WORK - SHEET METAL MECHANIC - REGULAR HOURS W/PROFIT AND OVERHEAD	60	81.12	4,867.20	80.00	4,800.00	86.00	5,160.00	NO BID	NO BID	120.00	7,200.00	
5	HOURLY SHOP CHARGES - SHEET METAL SHOP WORK - MECHANIC - REGULAR HOURS W/PROFIT AND OVERHEAD	60	81.12	4,867.20	80.00	4,800.00	50.00	3,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	120.00	7,200.00	
6	HOURLY CHARGE - AIR CONDITIONING/HEAT PUMP/ REFRIGERATION - MECHANIC'S HELPER - REGULAR HOURS W/PROFIT & OVERHEAD	200	36.13	7,226.00	45.00	9,000.00	40.00	8,000.00	109.00	21,800.00	68.00	13,600.00	
7	HOURLY CHARGE - AIR CONDITIONING/HEAT PUMP/ REFRIGERATION - MECHANIC -REGULAR HOURS W/PROFIT & OVERHEAD	200	85.00	17,000.00	80.00	16,000.00	86.00	17,200.00	109.00	21,800.00	120.00	24,000.00	
8	REPLACE THIRTY (30) ADMIN. BUILDING HEAT PUMP FILTERS, QUARTERLY	4	150.00	600.00	310.00	1,240.00	1,000.00	4,000.00	872.00	3,488.00	1,940.00	7,760.00	
9	REPLACE THIRTEEN (13) ADMIN. BUILDING AIR HANDLER FILTERS, QUARTERLY	4	150.00	600.00	225.00	900.00	600.00	2,400.00	654.00	2,616.00	840.00	3,360.00	
10	REPLACE NINE (9) ADMIN. BUILDING AIR HANDLER FILTERS, ANNUALLY	1	400.00	400.00	250.00	250.00	600.00	600.00	436.00	436.00	581.00	581.00	
11	WASH SIX (6) ADMIN. BUILDING AIR HANDLER FILTERS, QUARTERLY	4	150.00	600.00	120.00	480.00	400.00	1,600.00	109.00	436.00	240.00	960.00	
12	ADMIN. BUILDING AIR HANDLER INSPECTION, ANNUALLY	1	600.00	600.00	160.00	160.00	500.00	500.00	436.00	436.00	180.00	180.00	
13	LUMP SUM ALLOWANCE FOR PARTS AND LABOR FOR WHICH UNIT PRICES HAVE NOT BEEN ESTABLISHED (ALLOWANCE 60,000.00)	1	60,000.00	60,000.00	60,000.00	60,000.00	60,000.00	60,000.00	60,000.00	60,000.00	60,000.00	60,000.00	
TOTAL AMOUNT BID					109,206.00		110,330.00		114,940.00		119,732.00		143,961.00

