

ENGINEER'S		OPENING DATE:											
Part A: \$250,000.00		THURSDAY, MAY 9, 2019 @ 2:00 P.M.											
CONTRACT NUMBER AND TITLE				KEMIRA WATER SOLUTIONS, INC.		PVS TECHNOLOGIES, INC.		JCI JONES CHEMICALS, INC.		KUEHNE CHEMICAL CO., INC.			
CHEM-21-19 FURNISH AND DELIVER VARIOUS CHEMICALS TO CMC MUA REGIONAL WASTEWATER TREATMENT FACILITIES													
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT.PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT.PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT.PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT.PRICE	
	PART A: CHEM-21A-19 SUPPLY LIQUID FERRIC CHLORIDE												
1	MFG. AND TRADE NAME OF LIQUID FERRIC CHLORIDE		KEMIRA P14-111		PVS TECHNOLOGIES, INC.		NO BID		NO BID				
2	COUNTRY OF ORIGIN		USA		USA								
3	FIRM(S) DELIVERING CHEMICAL		KEMIRA		ALL CHEMICAL TRANSPORT, HAZMAT ENVIRN. GROUP, MC TANK TRANSPORT								
4	UNIT PRICE PER POUND OF LIQUID FERRIC CHLORIDE			0.3360		0.3475	KEMIRA WATER SOLUTIONS: MATH ERROR: LINE 7 - TOTAL CONTRACT AMOUNT: KEMIRA ENTERED LINE 6 ADJUSTED UNIT PRICE PER POUND. THE TOTAL CONTRACT AMOUNT ON THE PROPOSAL PAGE SAYS \$255,825.00, SHOULD BE \$252,000.00						
5	SPILL COMPENSATION AND CONTROL TAX			0.0051		0.0053							
	WILL PROVIDE SECONDARY TRANSFER CERTIFICATE (ENTER 0.00 ON LINE 5)												
	WILL NOT PROVIDE SECONDARY TRANSFER CERTIFICATE (ENTER 1.53% OF LINE 4 ON LINE 5)		X		X								
6	ADJUSTED UNIT PRICE PER POUND OF LIQUID FERRIC CHLORIDE (SUM OF LINE 4 AND LINE 5 - FOR BID EVALUATION PURPOSES)			0.3411		0.3528							
7	TOTAL CONTRACT AMOUNT (FOR DETERMINING SIZE OF BID BOND)	750,000	0.3360	252,000.00	0.3475	260,625.00							
	750,000 POUNDS X LINE 4												
	BIDDER'S CHECKLIST			X		X	PVS TECHNOLOGIES: MATH ERROR: LINE 7 - TOTAL CONTRACT AMOUNT: PVS ENTERED LINE 6 ADJUSTED UNIT PRICE PER POUND, SHOULD HAVE BEEN THE LINE 4 UNIT PRICE PER POUND. THE TOTAL CONTRACT AMOUNT ON THE PROPOSAL PAGE SAYS \$264,600.00, SHOULD BE \$260,625.00						
	BID GUARANTEE			X		X							
	STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE			X		X							
	NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT			X		X							
	DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN			X		X							
	CONSENT OF SURETY			X		X							
	EMERGENCY CONTACT INFORMATION			X		NO							
	BIDDER'S EXPERIENCE / REFERENCES			X		X							
	SDS (SAFETY DATA SHEETS)			X		X							
	MANUFACTURER'S SPECIFICATION SHEET			X		X							
	REFERENCES FOR EQUIVALENT PRODUCTS (IF APPLICABLE)			N/A		N/A							
	PROPOSAL FORM(S)			X		X							
	ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT			X		X							
	N.J. BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE			X		X							
	IRS FORM W-9			X		X							
	INSURANCE CERTIFICATE			X	**EVIDENCE ONLY	**X							
	MANDATORY AFFIRMATIVE ACTION			X		X							

ENGINEER'S		OPENING DATE:										
PART B: \$45,000.00		THURSDAY, MAY 9, 2019 @ 2:00 P.M.										
CONTRACT NUMBER AND TITLE				JCI JONES CHEMICALS, INC.		KUEHNE CHEMICAL CO., INC.		KEMIRA WATER SOLUTIONS, INC.		PVS TECHNOLOGIES, INC.		
CHEM-21-19 FURNISH AND DELIVER VARIOUS CHEMICALS TO CMC MUA REGIONAL WASTEWATER TREATMENT FACILITIES												
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE
	PART B: CHEM-21B-19 SUPPLY CHLORINE											
1	MFG. AND TRADE NAME OF CHLORINE		AXIALL - CHLORINE		NO BID		NO BID					
2	COUNTRY OF ORIGIN		USA		USA							
3	FIRM(S) DELIVERING CHEMICAL		JCI JONES CHEMICALS, INC.		KUEHNE							
4	UNIT PRICE PER POUND OF CHLORINE			0.2845		0.40						
5	SPILL COMPENSATION AND CONTROL TAX			0.00435285		ZERO						
	WILL PROVIDE SECONDARY TRANSFER CERTIFICATE (ENTER 0.00 ON LINE 5)				X							
	WILL NOT PROVIDE SECONDARY TRANSFER CERTIFICATE (ENTER 1.53% OF LINE 4 ON LINE 5)		X									
6	ADJUSTED UNIT PRICE PER POUND OF CHLORINE (SUM OF LINE 4 AND LINE 5 - FOR BID EVALUATION PURPOSES)			0.28885285		0.40						
7	TOTAL CONTRACT AMOUNT (FOR DETERMINING SIZE OF BID BOND)	160,000	0.2845	45,520.00	0.40	64,000.00						
	160,000 POUNDS X LINE 4											
	BIDDER'S CHECKLIST			X		X						
	BID GUARANTEE			X		X						
	STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE			X		X						
	NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT			X		X						
	DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN			X		X						
	CONSENT OF SURETY			X		X						
	EMERGENCY CONTACT INFORMATION			X		X						
	BIDDER'S EXPERIENCE / REFERENCES			X		X						
	SDS (SAFETY DATA SHEETS)			X		X						
	MANUFACTURER'S SPECIFICATION SHEET			X		X						
	REFERENCES FOR EQUIVALENT PRODUCTS (IF APPLICABLE)			N/A		N/A						
	PROPOSAL FORM(S)			X		X						
	ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT			X		X						
	N.J. BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE			X		X						
	IRS FORM W-9			X		X						
	INSURANCE CERTIFICATE			X		X						
	MANDATORY AFFIRMATIVE ACTION			X		X						