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ITEM QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE

1 1 N/A 15,000.00 N/A 15,000.00 N/A 15,000.00

2 25 60.00 1,500.00 105.00 2,625.00 128.00 3,200.00
3 100 60.00 6,000.00 105.00 10,500.00 128.00 12,800.00

22,500.00 28,125.00 31,000.00

X X X
X X X
X X X
X X X
X X X
X X X
X X X
X NO X
X X X
X X NO
X X X
X X X

J&T wrote in "Exception: We 
will supply parts at 20% above 

our costs"

PROPOSAL FORM(S)
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

BIDDER'S EXPERIENCE / REFERENCES
ADDITIONAL BIDDER'S QUALIFICATIONS

MANDATORY AFFIRMATIVE ACTION

N.J. BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE
IRS FORM W-9

DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN

TOTAL AMOUNT BID FOR PART A

BIDDER'S CHECKLIST
STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

HOURLY RATE FOR TROUBLESHOOTING/DIAGNOSTIC SERVICE
HOURLY RATE FOR REPAIR SERVICE

ALLOWANCE OF $15,000.00 HAS BEEN PROVIDED IN THE BID

PART A: FREIGHTLINER TRUCKS
ALL PARTS/MATERIALS SUPPLIED BY THE CONTRACTOR AND 
INCORPORATED INTO THE WORK, AT INVOICED COST PLUS A
MAXIMUM OF 15% FOR PROFIT AND OVERHEAD. AN 

FOR THESE PURPOSES AND FOR BID COMPARISON
PURPOSES.

HOUPERT FLEET 
SERVICES

CRUZAN'S TRUCK 
SERVICE INC. JOHNSON & TOWERS

DESCRIPTION

MUA-EQUIP-17-19 PROVIDE REPAIR SERVICES FOR VARIOUS TRUCKS FOR THE CAPE 
MAY COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITIES AUTHORITY

OPENING DATE
PART A: $35,000.00 TUESDAY, MAY 21, 2019 @ 2:00 P.M.

CONTRACT NUMBER AND TITLE

HFS "Total Amount in Words" 
is incorrectly stated as twenty 
three thousand one hundred 

twentty five dollars

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE(S)

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT
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ITEM QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXT.PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT.PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT.PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT.PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT.PRICE

1 1 N/A 20,000.00 N/A 20,000.00

2 25 60.00 1,500.00 105.00 2,625.00
3 100 60.00 6,000.00 105.00 10,500.00

27,500.00 33,125.00 NO BID

HFS typed in $22,500.00, for 
total amount bid.

BIDDER'S EXPERIENCE / REFERENCES
ADDITIONAL BIDDER'S QUALIFICATIONS

MANDATORY AFFIRMATIVE ACTION

IRS FORM W-9
INSURANCE CERTIFICATE(S)

ALLOWANCE OF $20,000.00 HAS BEEN PROVIDED IN THE BID
FOR THESE PURPOSES AND FOR BID COMPARISON

TOTAL AMOUNT BID FOR PART B

JOHNSON & TOWERS

PURPOSES.
HOURLY RATE FOR TROUBLESHOOTING/DIAGNOSTIC SERVICE
HOURLY RATE FOR REPAIR SERVICE

HFS "Total Amount in Words" 
is incorrectly stated as twenty 
three thousand one hundred 

twentty five dollars

PART B: $40,000.00 TUESDAY, MAY 21, 2019 @ 2:00 P.M.

CONTRACT NUMBER AND  TITLE
MUA-EQUIP-17-19 PROVIDE REPAIR SERVICES FOR VARIOUS TRUCKS FOR THE CAPE 
MAY COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITIES AUTHORITY

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE  : OPENING DATE:

HOUPERT FLEET 
SERVICES

CRUZAN'S TRUCK 
SERVICE INC.

DESCRIPTION
PART B: MACK TRUCKS
ALL PARTS/MATERIALS SUPPLIED BY THE CONTRACTOR AND 
INCORPORATED INTO THE WORK, AT INVOICED COST PLUS A
MAXIMUM OF 15% FOR PROFIT AND OVERHEAD. AN 

BIDDER'S CHECKLIST
STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT
DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT
PROPOSAL FORM(S)

N.J. BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE
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ITEM QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXT.PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT.PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT.PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT.PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT.PRICE

1 1 N/A 10,000.00

2 12 105.00 1,260.00
3 25 105.00 2,625.00

NO BID 13,885.00 NO BID

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE(S)

N.J. BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE
IRS FORM W-9

MANDATORY AFFIRMATIVE ACTION

DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN
BIDDER'S EXPERIENCE / REFERENCES

ADDITIONAL BIDDER'S QUALIFICATIONS

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT
PROPOSAL FORM(S)

ALL PARTS/MATERIALS SUPPLIED BY THE CONTRACTOR AND 
INCORPORATED INTO THE WORK, AT INVOICED COST PLUS A
MAXIMUM OF 15% FOR PROFIT AND OVERHEAD. AN 
ALLOWANCE OF $20,000.00 HAS BEEN PROVIDED IN THE BID
FOR THESE PURPOSES AND FOR BID COMPARISON

BIDDER'S CHECKLIST

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE  : OPENING DATE:

HOUPERT FLEET 
SERVICES

CRUZAN'S TRUCK 
SERVICE INC.

DESCRIPTION
PART C: VERSALIFT TRUCKS

JOHNSON & TOWERS

PART C: $30,000.00 THURSDAY, MAY 21, 2019 @ 2:00 P.M.

CONTRACT NUMBER AND  TITLE
MUA-EQUIP-17-19 PROVIDE REPAIR SERVICES FOR VARIOUS TRUCKS FOR THE CAPE 
MAY COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITIES AUTHORITY

PURPOSES.
HOURLY RATE FOR TROUBLESHOOTING/DIAGNOSTIC SERVICE
HOURLY RATE FOR REPAIR SERVICE

TOTAL AMOUNT BID FOR PART C

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT
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ITEM QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE

1 1 N/A 10,000.00 N/A 10,000.00

2 15 60.00 900.00 105.00 1,575.00
3 30 60.00 1,800.00 105.00 3,150.00

12,700.00 14,725.00 NO BID

JOHNSON & TOWERS

PART D: $30,000.00 TUESDAY, MAY 21, 2019 @ 2:00 P.M.

CONTRACT NUMBER AND TITLE
MUA-EQUIP-17-19 PROVIDE REPAIR SERVICES FOR VARIOUS TRUCKS FOR THE CAPE 
MAY COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITIES AUTHORITY

DESCRIPTION

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE OPENING DATE

HOUPERT FLEET 
SERVICES

CRUZAN'S TRUCK 
SERVICE INC.

PART D: VOLVO TRUCKS

HOURLY RATE FOR REPAIR SERVICE

TOTAL AMOUNT BID FOR PART D

ALL PARTS/MATERIALS SUPPLIED BY THE CONTRACTOR AND 
INCORPORATED INTO THE WORK, AT INVOICED COST PLUS A
MAXIMUM OF 15% FOR PROFIT AND OVERHEAD. AN 
ALLOWANCE OF $10,000.00 HAS BEEN PROVIDED IN THE BID
FOR THESE PURPOSES AND FOR BID COMPARISON

HOURLY RATE FOR TROUBLESHOOTING/DIAGNOSTIC SERVICE
PURPOSES.

BIDDER'S CHECKLIST
STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT
DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN

BIDDER'S EXPERIENCE / REFERENCES
ADDITIONAL BIDDER'S QUALIFICATIONS

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT
N.J. BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE

IRS FORM W-9

MANDATORY AFFIRMATIVE ACTION

PROPOSAL FORM(S)

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE(S)

HFS "Total Amount in Words" 
is incorrectly stated as twelve 
thousand nine hundred twenty 

five dollars
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ITEM QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE

1 1 N/A 45,000.00 N/A 45,000.00         

2 50 60.00 3,000.00 105.00           5,250.00           
3 200 60.00 12,000.00 105.00           21,000.00         

60,000.00 71,250.00         NO BID

IRS FORM W-9
INSURANCE CERTIFICATE(S)

MANDATORY AFFIRMATIVE ACTION

DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN
BIDDER'S EXPERIENCE / REFERENCES

ADDITIONAL BIDDER'S QUALIFICATIONS
PROPOSAL FORM(S)

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT
N.J. BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT

TOTAL AMOUNT BID FOR PART E

BIDDER'S CHECKLIST

HOURLY RATE FOR TROUBLESHOOTING/DIAGNOSTIC SERVICE
HOURLY RATE FOR ON-SITE REPAIR SERVICE

CRUZAN'S TRUCK 
SERVICE INC.

PART E: $65,000.00 TUESDAY, MAY 21, 2019 @ 2:00 P.M.

MAXIMUM OF 15% FOR PROFIT AND OVERHEAD. AN 

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

CONTRACT NUMBER AND TITLE

OPENING DATE

HOUPERT FLEET 
SERVICES

ALLOWANCE OF $45,000.00 HAS BEEN PROVIDED IN THE BID

JOHNSON & TOWERS

MUA-EQUIP-17-19 PROVIDE REPAIR SERVICES FOR VARIOUS TRUCKS FOR THE CAPE 
MAY COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITIES AUTHORITY

HFS "Total Amount in Words" 
is incorrectly stated as sixty 
one thousand two hundred 

fifty dollars

DESCRIPTION
PART E: KENWORTH TRUCKS
ALL PARTS/MATERIALS SUPPLIED BY THE CONTRACTOR AND 
INCORPORATED INTO THE WORK, AT INVOICED COST PLUS A

FOR THESE PURPOSES AND FOR BID COMPARISON
PURPOSES.
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ITEM QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE

1 1 N/A 25,000.00 N/A 25,000.00 N/A 25,000.00 0.00 0.00

2 50 60.00 3,000.00 105.00 5,250.00 128.00 6,400.00 0.00 0.00
3 100 60.00 6,000.00 105.00 10,500.00 128.00 12,800.00 0.00 0.00

34,000.00 40,750.00 44,200.00 0.00 0.00

J&T wrote in "Exception: We 
will supply parts at 20% above 

our costs"

DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN
BIDDER'S EXPERIENCE / REFERENCES

MANDATORY AFFIRMATIVE ACTION

BIDDER'S CHECKLIST

ADDITIONAL BIDDER'S QUALIFICATIONS
PROPOSAL FORM(S)

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT
N.J. BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE

IRS FORM W-9
INSURANCE CERTIFICATE(S)

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT

TOTAL AMOUNT BID FOR PART F

MAXIMUM OF 15% FOR PROFIT AND OVERHEAD. AN 
ALLOWANCE OF $25,000.00 HAS BEEN PROVIDED IN THE BID
FOR THESE PURPOSES AND FOR BID COMPARISON
PURPOSES.
HOURLY RATE FOR TROUBLESHOOTING/DIAGNOSTIC SERVICE
HOURLY RATE FOR REPAIR SERVICE

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE OPENING DATE

HOUPERT FLEET 
SERVICES

PART F: WESTERN STAR TRUCKS
ALL PARTS/MATERIALS SUPPLIED BY THE CONTRACTOR AND 
INCORPORATED INTO THE WORK, AT INVOICED COST PLUS A

HFS "Total Amount in Words" 
is incorrectly stated as thirty 

four thousand seven hundred 
fifty dollars

CRUZAN'S TRUCK 
SERVICE INC.

DESCRIPTION
JOHNSON & TOWERS

PART F: $45,000.00 TUESDAY, MAY 21, 2019 @ 2:00 P.M.

CONTRACT NUMBER AND TITLE
MUA-EQUIP-17-19 PROVIDE REPAIR SERVICES FOR VARIOUS TRUCKS FOR THE CAPE 
MAY COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITIES AUTHORITY
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ITEM QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE
0.00 0.00

1 1 N/A 10,000.00 N/A 10,000.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

2 15 60.00 900.00 105.00 1,575.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3 30 60.00 1,800.00 105.00 3,150.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

12,700.00 14,725.00 NO BID 0.00 0.00

ADDITIONAL BIDDER'S QUALIFICATIONS
PROPOSAL FORM(S)

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT
N.J. BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE

IRS FORM W-9
INSURANCE CERTIFICATE(S)

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT
DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN

BIDDER'S EXPERIENCE / REFERENCES

MANDATORY AFFIRMATIVE ACTION

BIDDER'S CHECKLIST
STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE

TOTAL AMOUNT BID FOR PART G

MAXIMUM OF 15% FOR PROFIT AND OVERHEAD. AN 
ALLOWANCE OF $10,000.00 HAS BEEN PROVIDED IN THE BID
FOR THESE PURPOSES AND FOR BID COMPARISON
PURPOSES.
HOURLY RATE FOR TROUBLESHOOTING/DIAGNOSTIC SERVICE
HOURLY RATE FOR REPAIR SERVICE

OPENING DATE

HOUPERT FLEET 
SERVICES

CRUZAN'S TRUCK 
SERVICE INC.

PART G: FORD TRUCKS
ALL PARTS/MATERIALS SUPPLIED BY THE CONTRACTOR AND 
INCORPORATED INTO THE WORK, AT INVOICED COST PLUS A

HFS "Total Amount in Words" 
is incorrectly stated as twelve 
thousand nine hundred twenty 

five dollars

JOHNSON & TOWERS

PART G: $30,000.00 TUESDAY, MAY 21, 2019 @ 2:00 P.M.

CONTRACT NUMBER AND TITLE
MUA-EQUIP-17-19 PROVIDE REPAIR SERVICES FOR VARIOUS TRUCKS FOR THE CAPE 
MAY COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITIES AUTHORITY

DESCRIPTION

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE
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