

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE		OPENING DATE		Houpert Fleet Services, LLC		Bellmawr Truck Repair Co., Inc.		Demountable Concepts, Inc. dba DCI Fleet					
SEE *\$ FOR EACH ITEM		THURSDAY, JUNE 2, 2022 @ 2:00 P.M.											
CONTRACT NUMBER AND TITLE													
MUA-EQUIP-31-22 FURNISH AND DELIVER OEM AND/OR NON-OEM REPLACEMENT PARTS AND REPAIR SERVICES FOR VARIOUS HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS FOR THE CMCMUA													
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	
*\$30,000	<b>PART A: FREIGHTLINER TRUCKS</b>												
1	AMOUNT SET BY CMCMUA \$10,000	1				10,000.00		10,000.00					
2	HOURLY RATE FOR TROUBLESHOOTING/DIAGNOSTIC SERVICE	15		-	90.00	1,350.00	95.00	1,425.00		-		-	
3	HOURLY RATE FOR REPAIR SERVICE	50		-	90.00	4,500.00	95.00	4,750.00		-		-	
	<b>TOTAL AMOUNT BID FOR PART A</b>			<b>NO BID</b>				<b>15,850.00</b>			<b>16,175.00</b>		-
*\$55,000	<b>PART B: MACK TRUCKS</b>												
1	AMOUNT SET BY CMCMUA \$28,000	1		28,000.00		28,000.00		28,000.00					
2	HOURLY RATE FOR TROUBLESHOOTING/DIAGNOSTIC SERVICE	25	59.00	1,475.00	90.00	2,250.00	95.00	2,375.00		-		-	
3	HOURLY RATE FOR REPAIR SERVICE	100	59.00	5,900.00	90.00	9,000.00	<b>95.00</b>	9,500.00		-		-	
	<b>TOTAL AMOUNT BID FOR PART B</b>					<b>35,375.00</b>		<b>39,250.00</b>			<b>39,875.00</b>		-
*\$33,000	<b>PART C: VERSALIFT TRUCKS</b>												
1	AMOUNT SET BY CMCMUA \$15,000	1				15,000.00		15,000.00					
2	HOURLY RATE FOR TROUBLESHOOTING/DIAGNOSTIC SERVICE	12		-	90.00	1,080.00	95.00	1,140.00		-		-	
3	HOURLY RATE FOR REPAIR SERVICE	25		-	90.00	2,250.00	<b>95.00</b>	2,375.00		-		-	
	<b>TOTAL AMOUNT BID FOR PART C</b>			<b>NO BID</b>				<b>18,330.00</b>			<b>18,515.00</b>		-
*\$110,000	<b>PART D: KENWORTH TRUCKS</b>												
1	AMOUNT SET BY CMCMUA \$65,000	1				65,000.00		65,000.00					
2	HOURLY RATE FOR TROUBLESHOOTING/DIAGNOSTIC SERVICE	50		-	90.00	4,500.00	95	4,750.00		-		-	
3	HOURLY RATE FOR ON-SITE REPAIR SERVICE	200		-	90.00	18,000.00	95	19,000.00		-		-	
	<b>TOTAL AMOUNT BID FOR PART E</b>			<b>NO BID</b>				<b>87,500.00</b>			<b>88,750.00</b>		-
*\$75,000	<b>PART F: WESTERN STAR TRUCKS</b>												
1	AMOUNT SET BY CMCMUA \$45,000	1				45,000.00		45,000.00					
2	HOURLY RATE FOR TROUBLESHOOTING/DIAGNOSTIC SERVICE	50		-	90.00	4,500.00	95.00	4,750.00		-		-	
3	HOURLY RATE FOR REPAIR SERVICE	100		-	90.00	9,000.00	95.00	<b>9,500.00</b>		-		-	
	<b>TOTAL AMOUNT BID FOR PART E</b>			<b>NO BID</b>				<b>58,500.00</b>			<b>59,250.00</b>		-
		REQUIRED	PROVIDED		PROVIDED	180,180.00	PROVIDED		PROVIDED		PROVIDED		
	<b>BIDDER'S CHECKLIST</b>	x	yes		yes		yes						
	<b>STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE</b>	x	yes		yes		yes						
	<b>NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT</b>	x	yes		yes		yes						
	<b>PROPOSAL FORM(S)</b>	x	yes		yes		yes						
	<b>ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT</b>	x	yes		yes		yes						
	<b>DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN</b>		yes		yes		yes						
	<b>N.J. BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE</b>		yes	valid	yes	valid	yes	valid					
	<b>IRS FORM W-9</b>		yes		yes		yes						
	<b>INSURANCE CERTIFICATE(S)</b>		yes	CMCMUA named	no		yes	proof					
	<b>MANDATORY AFFIRMATIVE ACTION</b>		no		yes	15-Aug-2027	yes	15-Feb-2023					