

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE		OPENING DATE										
\$625,000.00		Tuesday June 27, 2023 @ 2:00 P.M.										
CONTRACT NUMBER AND TITLE				MV Technologies, LLC	Nichem Co.	Norit Americas, Inc.	Clear Technologies, LLC					
SLF-24-23 Furnish and Deliver Hydrogen Sulfide Removal Media to the Sanitary Landfill												
PART	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXT. PRICE
A	FURNISH & DELIVER BULK BAGS OF FILTER MEDIA WITH WOODCHIP AS SUBSTRATE	300	1,060.00	318,000.00	1,200.00	360,000.00	NO BID		NO BID			
A	ALLOWANCE FOR MISCELLANEOUS MATERIALS (AS SET BY THE AUTHORITY \$30,000.00)	1		30,000.00		30,000.00	NO BID		NO BID			
A	Total Amount Bid Part A			348,000.00		390,000.00	NO BID		NO BID			
B	FURNISH & DELIVER BULK BAGS OF FILTER MEDIA WITH CLAY PARTICLES AS SUBSTRATE	300	NO BID		1,970.00	591,000.00	NO BID		NO BID			
B	ALLOWANCE FOR MISCELLANEOUS MATERIALS (AS SET BY THE AUTHORITY \$30,000.00)	1	NO BID			30,000.00	NO BID		NO BID			
B	Total Amount Bid Part B		NO BID			621,000.00	NO BID		NO BID			
C	FURNISH & DELIVER BULK BAGS OF FILTER MEDIA WITH HYDROSCOPIC INERT BASE AS SUBSTRATE	300	1,887.00	566,100.00	1,740.00	522,000.00	NO BID		1,810.00	543,000.00		
C	ALLOWANCE FOR MISCELLANEOUS MATERIALS (AS SET BY THE AUTHORITY \$30,000.00)	1		30,000.00		30,000.00	NO BID			30,000.00		
C	Total Amount Bid Part C			596,100.00		552,000.00	NO BID			573,000.00		
D	FURNISH & DELIVER BULK BAGS OF FILTER MEDIA WITH LIGNITE-BASED COAL AS SUBSTRATE	300	NO BID		NO BID		1,970.00	591,000.00	NO BID			
D	ALLOWANCE FOR MISCELLANEOUS MATERIALS (AS SET BY THE AUTHORITY \$30,000.00)	1	NO BID		NO BID			30,000.00	NO BID			
D	Total Amount Bid Part C		NO BID		NO BID			621,000.00	NO BID			
		Required	Provided		Provided		Provided		Provided		Provided	
	BIDDER'S CHECKLIST	x	yes		yes		yes		yes			
	STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE	x	yes		yes		yes		yes			
	NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT	x	yes		yes		yes		yes			
	PROPOSAL FORM(S)	x	yes		yes		yes		yes			
	ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT	x	yes		yes		yes		yes			
	CHECKLIST - DOCUMENT A		yes		yes		no		yes			
	NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE		yes	valid	yes	valid	yes	valid	yes	valid		
	PROHIBITED RUSSIA-BELARUS ACTIVITIES & IRAN INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES		yes	clear search	yes	clear search	yes		yes	clear search		
	IRS FORM W-9		yes		yes		yes		yes			
	CHECKLIST - DOCUMENT B		no		no		no		no			
	MANDATORY AFFIRMATIVE ACTION		no		no		no		no			
	INSURANCE CERTIFICATE(S)		no		yes	CMCMUA named with endorsements	no		no			